G:\CMTE\EC\INEP\ECPA\ANS_HR1355_01.XML

AMENDMENT IN THE NATURE OF A SUBSTITUTE
TO H.R. 1355

OFFERED BY M .

Strike all after the enacting clause and insert the

following:

[E—

O o0 9 AN U Bk~ W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the “Weatherization En-
hancement and Readiness Act of 2025,

SEC. 2. WEATHERIZATION.

(a) AVERAGE CosT PER DWELLING UNIT.—Section
415(¢)(1) of the Energy Conservation and Production Act
(42 U.S.C. 6865(¢)(1)) is amended by striking “$6,500”
and inserting “$12,000".

(b) REAUTHORIZATION OF WEATHERIZATION AS-
SISTANCE PROGRAM.—Section 422 of the Energy Con-
servation and Production Act (42 U.S.C. 6872) 1s amend-
ed by striking paragraphs (1) and (2) and inserting the
following:

“(1) $300,000,000 for each of fiscal years 2026

through 2028;

“(2) $325,000,000 for fiscal year 2029; and
“(3) $350,000,000 for fiscal year 2030.”.

g:\V\F\120225\F120225.043.xml (103428912)
December 2, 2025 (7:37 p.m.)



G:\CMTE\EC\INEP\ECPA\ANS_HR1355_01.XML

2
1 SEC. 3. READINESS REPORT.

2 Section 414D(i) of the Energy Conservation and Pro-
3 duction Act (42 U.S.C. 6864d(1)) 1s amended—

(1) in paragraph (1), by striking *‘; and” and
serting a semicolon;

(2) in paragraph (2), by striking ‘“achieved.”
and inserting “achieved; and”’; and

(3) by adding at the end the following:

O o0 9 N »n B

“(3) the impacts of enhancement and innova-
10 tion readiness efforts on eligibility for the weather-

11 ization program conducted under this part.”.

g:\V\F\120225\F120225.043.xml (103428912)
December 2, 2025 (7:37 p.m.)




Amendment in the Nature of a Substitute to H.R. 1355


Offered by M_. ______


Strike all after the enacting clause and insert the following:


SECTION 1. Short title.

This Act may be cited as the “Weatherization Enhancement and Readiness Act of 2025”.


SEC. 2. Weatherization.

(a) Average cost per dwelling unit.—Section 415(c)(1) of the Energy Conservation and Production Act (42 U.S.C. 6865(c)(1)) is amended by striking “$6,500” and inserting “$12,000”.


(b) Reauthorization of Weatherization Assistance Program.—Section 422 of the Energy Conservation and Production Act (42 U.S.C. 6872) is amended by striking paragraphs (1) and (2) and inserting the following:


“(1) $300,000,000 for each of fiscal years 2026 through 2028;


“(2) $325,000,000 for fiscal year 2029; and


“(3) $350,000,000 for fiscal year 2030.”.


SEC. 3. Readiness report.

Section 414D(i) of the Energy Conservation and Production Act (42 U.S.C. 6864d(i)) is amended—


(1) in paragraph (1), by striking “; and” and inserting a semicolon;


(2) in paragraph (2), by striking “achieved.” and inserting “achieved; and”; and


(3) by adding at the end the following: 


“(3) the impacts of enhancement and innovation readiness efforts on eligibility for the weatherization program conducted under this part.”.



  
   G:\CMTE\EC\19\EP\ECPA\ANS_HR1355_01.XML  XXXXXX 12/2/2025 19:37 XXXXXX 12/02/2025 6:25 PM  XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXX   1034289|2  
  
 [Discussion Draft] 
  
 [Discussion Draft] 
  
  
 
  
  
 119th CONGRESS  1st Session 
 Amendment in the Nature of a Substitute to H.R. 1355 
  
 Offered by M_. ______ 
  
 
 
    
  Strike all after the enacting clause and insert the following: 
  
  1. Short title This Act may be cited as the   Weatherization Enhancement and Readiness Act of 2025. 
  2. Weatherization 
  (a) Average cost per dwelling unit Section 415(c)(1) of the Energy Conservation and Production Act (42 U.S.C. 6865(c)(1)) is amended by striking  $6,500 and inserting  $12,000. 
  (b) Reauthorization of Weatherization Assistance Program Section 422 of the Energy Conservation and Production Act (42 U.S.C. 6872) is amended by striking paragraphs (1) and (2) and inserting the following: 
  
  (1) $300,000,000 for each of fiscal years 2026 through 2028; 
  (2) $325,000,000 for fiscal year 2029; and 
  (3) $350,000,000 for fiscal year 2030. . 
  3. Readiness report Section 414D(i) of the Energy Conservation and Production Act (42 U.S.C. 6864d(i)) is amended— 
  (1) in paragraph (1), by striking  ; and and inserting a semicolon; 
  (2) in paragraph (2), by striking  achieved. and inserting  achieved; and; and 
  (3) by adding at the end the following: 
  
  (3) the impacts of enhancement and innovation readiness efforts on eligibility for the weatherization program conducted under this part. . 
 

